
This Mobile Application End User License Agreement (“Agreement”) is a binding agreement between you (“you”) and 
Reflection Sciences, Inc. (“Company”). This Agreement governs your use of the Minnesota Executive Function Scale 
application, including all related products, services, and documentation (the “Application”).  

BY ELECTRONICALLY ACCEPTING THIS AGREEMENT AND/OR DOWNLOADING THE APPLICATION, 
YOU (A) ACKNOWLEDGE THAT YOU HAVE READ AND UNDERSTAND THIS AGREEMENT; AND (B) 
ACCEPT THIS AGREEMENT AND AGREE THAT YOU ARE LEGALLY BOUND BY ITS TERMS. IF YOU DO 
NOT AGREE TO THESE TERMS, DO NOT USE THE APPLICATION AND PLEASE DELETE IT FROM YOUR 
MOBILE DEVICE.  

In addition to the above, you acknowledge that when you download, install or use the Application, Company may use 
automatic means to collect certain information about your access to and use of the Application.  You may also be required 
to provide certain information about yourself at the time of registration, while using the Application, or for 
troubleshooting problems with the Application. All information we collect through or in connection with this Application 
is subject to our Privacy Policy available at http://reflectionsciences.com/privacy-policy/. By using and providing 
information to or through this Application, you consent to all actions taken by us with respect to your information in 
compliance with the Privacy Policy. 

1. License Grant. Subject to the terms of this Agreement, Company grants you a limited, non-exclusive and 
nontransferable license to download, install and use the Application on an iPad or Android mobile device owned or 
otherwise controlled by you (“Mobile Device”) for educational and/or research purposes only.  

2. License Restrictions. You shall not:  

a. copy the Application;  
b. modify, translate, adapt or otherwise create derivative works or improvements, whether or not patentable, of the 

Application;  
c. reverse engineer, disassemble, decompile, decode or otherwise attempt to derive or gain access to the source 

code of the Application;  
d. remove, delete, alter, or obscure any trademarks, copyright or other proprietary rights notices from the 

Application; or 
e. rent, lease, lend, sell, sublicense, assign, distribute, publish, transfer or otherwise make available the Application 

or any features or functionality of the Application, to any third party for any reason.  

3. Intellectual Property Rights. You acknowledge and agree that the Application is licensed, and not sold, to you. You 
do not acquire any ownership interest in the Application under this Agreement or any rights other than to use the 
Application in accordance with the terms of this Agreement.  Except as expressly granted to you in this Agreement, 
Company reserves and retains all right, title and interest, including all intellectual property rights, in and to the 
Application.  

4.  Confidentiality. You acknowledge and agree that the Application is Company’s proprietary and confidential 
information. You further agree that the Application will be used by you solely in accordance with the terms of this 
Agreement and that you will treat the Application in a confidential and secure manner. In the event of a breach of your 
obligations under this Section, Company may apply (subject to Section 9 below) for specific performance and/or 
injunctive relief to enforce or prevent the violations of this Agreement.  Such enforcement is in addition to and not in lieu 
of Company’s right to bring an action for and to recover damages with respect to your breach.  

5. Updates. Company may from time to time, in its sole discretion, develop and provide updates to the Application. You 
shall promptly download and install all updates and acknowledge and agree that the Application or portions thereof may 
not properly operate should you fail to do so. All updates will be deemed a part of the Application and will be subject to 
the terms of this Agreement. 



6. Term and Termination. The term of this Agreement commences when you acknowledge your acceptance and continues 
for one (1) year from the date of your acceptance. You may terminate this Agreement by deleting the Application and all 
copies from your Mobile Device. Company may terminate this Agreement at any time without notice for any reason. 
This Agreement will terminate automatically without notice if you violate any terms of the Agreement.  Upon 
termination, your rights to the Application terminate and you must cease all use of the Application and delete all copies 
from your Mobile Device.  

7. Warranties. THE APPLICATION IS PROVIDED TO YOU “AS-IS” AND WITH ALL FAULTS AND DEFECTS 
WITHOUT WARRANTY OF ANY KIND. TO THE EXTENT PERMITTED UNDER APPLICABLE LAW, 
COMPANY DISCLAIMS ALL WARRANTIES WHETHER EXPRESS, IMPLIED, STATUTORY OR OTHERWISE 
WITH RESPECT TO THE APPLICATION.  WITHOUT LIMITING THE FOREGOING, COMPANY MAKES NO 
REPRESENTATIONS OR WARRANTIES WITH RESPECT TO THE ACCURACY OR COMPLETENESS OF THE 
APPLICATION OR THAT THE APPLICATION WILL MEET YOUR REQUIREMENTS, ACHIEVE ANY 
INTENDED RESULTS, OR BE ERROR FREE OR UNINTERRUPTED.  SOME JURISDICTIONS DO NOT ALLOW 
THE EXCLUSION OR LIMITATIONS ON IMPLIED WARRANTIES OR THE LIMITATION ON APPLICABLE 
STATUTORY RIGHTS OF A CONSUMER, SO SOME OR ALL OF THE ABOVE EXCLUSIONS AND 
LIMITATIONS MAY NOT APPLY TO YOU. IF AND TO THE EXTENT ANY WARRANTY EXISTS UNDER 
APPLICABLE LAW THAT CANNOT BE DISCLAIMED, COMPANY, NOT APPLE OR GOOGLE, WILL BE 
SOLELY RESPONSIBLE FOR SUCH WARRANTY. 

8. Limitation of Liability. TO THE FULL EXTENT PERMITTED BY APPLICABLE LAW, IN NO EVENT WILL 
COMPANY HAVE ANY LIABILITY ARISING FROM OR RELATED TO YOUR USE OR INABILITY TO USE 
THE APPLICATION, INCLUDING ANY DIRECT, SPECIAL, INCIDENTAL, EXEMPLARY, OR 
CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES ARISING OUT OF OR IN CONNECTION WITH THIS AGREEMENT OR THE 
APPLICATION WHETHER OR NOT COMPANY HAS BEEN ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH 
DAMAGES. SOME STATES DO NOT ALLOW CERTAIN LIMITATIONS OF LIABILITY, SO THE ABOVE 
LIMITATION OR EXCLUSION MAY NOT APPLY TO YOU. IF APPLICABLE LAW LIMITS THE APPLICATION 
OF THE PROVISIONS OF THIS SECTION, COMPANY’S LIABILITY WILL BE LIMITED TO THE MAXIMUM 
EXTENT PERMISSIBLE. 

9. Governing Law.  This Agreement is for the benefit of the Company and shall be governed by and construed in 
accordance with the laws of the State of Minnesota. Any legal suit, action or proceeding arising out of or relating to this 
Agreement or the Application will be brought exclusively in the courts of Hennepin County, Minnesota.  

10. Waiver. You acknowledge and agree that no failure or delay by the Company in exercising any right, power or 
privilege hereunder shall operate as a waiver thereof, nor shall any single or partial exercise thereof preclude any other 
or further exercise thereof or the exercise of any right, power or privilege hereunder. 

11. This Agreement is between you and Company.  Apple, Inc. (“Apple”) and Google (Android) are not parties to this 
Agreement.  As between Company and Apple or Google, Company is solely responsible for the Application, including 
its content and maintenance.  Although Apple, Google, and their subsidiaries are not parties to this Agreement and have 
no obligations to you under this Agreement, Apple, Google, and their subsidiaries have the right (and will be deemed to 
have accepted the right) to enforce this Agreement against you as a third party beneficiary.  

12. Restricted Parties.  By accepting this Agreement, you hereby represent and warrant that (a) you are not located in a 
country that is subject to a U.S. Government embargo, or that has been designated by the U.S. Government as a “terrorist 
supporting” country; and (b) you are not listed on any U.S. Government list of prohibited or restricted parties. 

  


